
QUALITY INITIATIVES & ACTION TAKEN REPORT BY IQAC 2022-23 
 

Meeting 
Details  

Suggestions/Proposals & 
Decisions 

 

Action taken report by 
IQAC 

Meet 01 

 

30 July 

2022 

 

 Restructuring of Internal Quality 
Assurance Cell 
 
 
 

 

 Establishment of Institutional 
Innovation council 
 

 Renovation of Administrative 
office 

 

 Construction Vermicompost 

tank 
 Conducting value added 

Courses 
 
 
 
 
 

 Conducting Project work, 

Assignment & Internship 
 

 The Internal Quality Assurance 
cell was reorganized in which Dr. 
Suman singh was nominated as 
IQAC Chairperson and Smt. 
Swapnil Pandey, Dr. Dheeraj 
Kumar  were nominated as 
member. 

 Institutional Innovation council 
was Registered. 
 
 

 Administrative Office renovation 
is in progress  
 
 

 It was constructed on 17 October 
2022. 
 

 Various value added courses 
was conducted like Basic 
Computer Course, 
Communication Skill, Sand Art, 
Terracotta Jewelry Making & tie 
& Dye, Food Preservation, 
Portrait Making, Painting, Yoga 
and Meditation and Research 
Methodology etc. 

 All Departments were conducted 

Project work Assignment and 

internship activity in each 

semester. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 
Meet 02 

 
31 October 

2022 

 Organizing competitions for 
talent development of the 
students. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 Organizing collaborative 
activities with other 
organization/institution. 

 Certification of ISO 
 

 

 

 Industrial visit and training 
 

 

 

 

 

 Awareness Program in adopted  
village. 
 

 For talent development among 
students Hindi & English Speech 
competition, General knowledge 
competition, Debate competition, 
Essay Writing competition, Quiz 
competition, Rangoli competition, 
Mehndi competitions and Sports 
competition were organized. 

 
 

 Various collaborative activities 
organized with the joint aegis of 
other organization/Institution. 

 The college is certified by ISO 
9001:2015 and ISO 1400:2015 
for Quality Management System 
and Environment Management 
System on 08 Dec 2022. 

 Industrial training and visit 
conducted by various 
departments like Computer 
Application dept.(25/01/2023), 
Home Science dept. (05/12/2022 
& 09/05/2023) and Commerce 
dept. etc. 

 Awareness Programs were 
organized in the adopted village 
(Ghunghun kotha) by various 
departments on subjects like 
Education, Health, Cleanliness, 
Voting Awareness, Government 
Schemes and Environment 

Protection etc. 
Meet 03 

 
31 January 

2023 

 Conducting Academic and 
Administrative Audit 

 

 Organizing National seminar 
and workshop 
 
 

 
 

 Documentation related to AQAR 
2021-22. 

 

 Installation of water cooler in 

Girls Hostel 
 

 Updating the college website. 
 
 

 Signing MoUs from other 

organizations and institutions 

 Internal Departmental Academic 
Audit and External Academic 
Administrative Audit was 
conducted on 30/04/2023. 

 Seminars and workshops were 
organized on various relevant 
topics and an International 
webinar was organized by the 
Hindi Department on the topic of 
Hindi Bhasha me Bhojpuri Ki 
Upadeyta on 14/09/2022. 

 It was documented. 
 

 

 It was installed in the month of 

May 2023. 
 College website updated keeping 

in mind NAAC Criteria 
 Many MOU’s were signed with 

other organizations and 



 Institutions during this session 
and collaborative activities were 
conducted with them. 

Meet 04 
 

28 April 
2023 

 

 Annual Action Plan for new 
academic Year 2023-24. 
 

 Uploading AQAR of the session 
2021-22 on NAAC Portal. 

 

 Arranging scholarship / free ship 

by the college to support the 

economically weaker students. 
 

 Subscription of Journals and E-
Journals for college library. 

 

 Conducting counseling, 
guidance and remedial classes 
for slow and fast learners. 

 Annual Action plan for Academic 
year 2023-24 was developed by 
IQAC. 

 AQAR (2021-22) uploaded on 
NAAC Portal on 28 July 2023 
successfully. 

 The College reduced the fees of 
economically weaker students 
and the library also made 
arrangements for additional 
books for them. 

 Some new Journals and E- 
Journals subscribed by the 
library. 

 On the basic of internal 
assessment, slow and fast 
learners were selected and 
additional counseling guidance 
and remedial classes were 
arranged for them. 

 

 

 

    


